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C. Appendix 
 

GLOSSARY 
 
Some of the terms in this glossary will be defined in more detail in the legal instructions you are 
given. The definitions in the instructions must be followed and must control your deliberations. 
 
[Add any technical terms from the art involved that may be used during trial and have agreed upon 
definitions. Delete any of the following terms which may not be applicable in a particular case.] 
 
Abstract: A brief summary of the technical disclosure in a patent to enable the U.S. Patent and 
Trademark Office and the public to determine quickly the nature and gist of the technical 
disclosure in the patent. 
 
Amendment: A patent applicant’s change to one or more claims or to the specification either in 
response to an office action taken by an Examiner or independently by the patent applicant during 
the patent application examination process. 
 
Anticipation: A situation in which a claimed invention is described in a single piece of prior art 
and, therefore, is not considered new and is not entitled to be patented. 
 
Assignment: A transfer of patent rights to another called an “assignee” who, upon transfer, 
becomes the owner of the rights assigned. 
 
Claim: Each claim of a patent is a concise, formal definition of an invention and appears at the 
end of the specification in a separately numbered paragraph.  In concept, a patent claim marks the 
boundaries of the patent in the same way that a legal description in a deed specifies the boundaries 
of land, i.e., similar to a landowner who can prevent others from trespassing on the bounded 
property, the inventor can prevent others from using what is claimed. Claims may be independent 
or dependent. An independent claim stands alone.  A dependent claim does not stand alone and 
refers to one or more other claims. A dependent claim incorporates whatever the other referenced 
claim or claims say. 
 
Conception: The complete mental part of the inventive act when the inventor forms a definite and 
permanent idea of an invention someone else could make without undue experimentation.  
Conception must be capable of proof, as by drawings, disclosure to another, etc.  
 
Drawings: The drawings are visual representations of the claimed invention contained in a patent 
application and issued patent, and usually include several figures illustrating various aspects of 
the claimed invention. 
 
Elements: The required parts of a device or the required steps of a method. A device or method 
infringes a patent if it contains each and every requirement of a patent claim. 
 
Embodiment: A product or method that contains the claimed invention. 
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Enablement: A description of the invention that is sufficient to enable persons skilled in the field 
of the invention to make and use the invention without undue experimentation. The specification 
of the patent must contain such an enabling description. 
 
Examination: Procedure before the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office whereby an Examiner 
reviews the filed patent application to determine if the claimed invention is patentable. 
 
Filing Date: Date a patent application, with all the required sections, has been submitted to the 
U.S. Patent and Trademark Office. 
 
Infringement: Violation of a patent occurring when someone makes, uses, or sells a patented 
invention, without permission of the patent holder, within the United States during the term of the 
patent. Infringement may be direct, by inducement, or contributory. Direct infringement is 
making, using, or selling the patented invention without permission. Inducing infringement is 
intentionally causing, urging or encouraging another to directly infringe a patent. Contributory 
infringement is offering to sell or selling an item that is a significant part of the invention, so that 
the buyer directly infringes the patent. To be a contributory infringer, one must know that the part 
being offered or sold is designed specifically for infringing the patented invention and is not a 
common object suitable for noninfringing uses. 
 
Limitation: A required part of an invention set forth in a patent claim. A limitation is a 
requirement of the invention. The word “limitation” is often used interchangeably with the word 
"requirement.” 
 
Nonobviousness: One of the requirements for securing a patent. To be valid, the subject matter 
of the invention must not have been obvious to a person of ordinary skill in the field at the time of 
[the earlier of the filing date of the patent application (post-AIA)]  [the invention (pre-AIA.] 
 
Office Action: A written communication from the Examiner to the patent applicant in the course 
of the application examination process. 
 
Patent: A patent is an exclusive right granted by the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office to an 
inventor to prevent others from making, using, or selling an invention for a term of 20 years from 
the date the patent application was filed (or, in some cases, 17 years from the date the patent 
issued). When the patent expires, the right to make, use, or sell the invention is dedicated to the 
public. The patent has three parts, which are a specification, drawings and claims. The patent is 
granted after examination by the U.S. Patent and Trademark Office of a patent application filed 
by the inventor which has these parts, and this examination is called the prosecution history. 
 
Patent and Trademark Office (PTO): An administrative branch of the U.S. Department of 
Commerce that is charged with overseeing and implementing the federal laws of patents and 
trademarks. It is responsible for examining all patent applications and issuing all patents in the 
United States. 
 
Prior Art: Evidence that the claimed invention was already known or would have been obvious. 
This evidence includes items that were publicly known or that have been used or offered for sale, 
or references such as publications or patents.   
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Prosecution History: The prosecution history is the complete written record of the proceedings 
in the PTO from the initial application to the issued patent. The prosecution history includes the 
office actions taken by the PTO and the amendments to the patent application filed by the applicant 
during the examination process. 
 
Reads On: A patent claim “reads on” a device or method when each required part (requirement) 
of the claim is found in the device or method. 
 
Reduction to Practice: The invention is “reduced to practice” when it is sufficiently developed 
to show that it would work for its intended purpose or when a patent application describing the 
invention is filed. 
 
Requirement: A required part or step of an invention set forth in a patent claim. The word 
“requirement” is often used interchangeably with the word “limitation.” 
 
Royalty: A royalty is a payment made to the owner of a patent by a nonowner in exchange for 
rights to make, use, or sell the claimed invention. 
 
Specification: The specification is a required part of a patent application and an issued patent. It 
is a written description of the invention and of the manner and process of making and using the 
claimed invention. 


